ARTICLE 1.

ARTICLE 2.

ARTICLE 3.

ARTICLE 4.

ARTICLE 5.

ARTICLE 6.

ARTICLE 7.

ARTICLE 8.

ARTICLE 9.

ARTICLE 10.

ARTICLE 11.

ARTICLE 12.

ARTICLE 13.

ARTICLE 14.

ARTICLE.15.

ARTICLE.16.

ARTICLE 17

ARTICLE 18.

ARTICLE 19.

ARTICLE 20.

ARTICLE 21.

CHAPTER 6

BUILDING CONSTRUCTION AND MAINTENANCE CODES

BUILDING CODE

CLASSIFICATION OF BUILDINGS

INSTALLATION OF UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANKS
PRIVATE RESIDENTIAL SWIMMING POOLS
DANGEROUS BUILDINGS

PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

REGULATING DEVELOPMENT IN SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD AREAS
ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

PLUMBING CODE

ELECTRICAL CODE

MECHANICAL CODE

ELEVATORS, DUMBWAITERS, ESCALATORS AND MOVABLE
PLATFORMS

BUILDING PERMITS

PERMIT AND INSPECTION FEES, BOND REQUIRED
ACCESSORY BUILDINGS, GARAGES AND SHEDS
FENCES

SIGNS

RENTAL HOUSING

EROSION AND SEDIMENT CONTROL

POST CONSTRUCTION STORM WATER RUNOFF

DEFAULTED, VACANT AND RENTAL PROPERTY REGISTRATION

Revised 12/16/2020, 3/17/10, 4/20/11,7/05/06, 2/06/08, 4/30/08



CHAPTER 6

BUILDING CONSTRUCTION AND MAINTENANCE CODES

ARTICLE 1. BUILDING CODE

SECTION

6-1-1: Building Code

6-1-2: International Residential Code

6-1-3: Adoption of Amendments

6-1-4: blank

6-1-5: Sidewalks

6-1-6: Storage Containers and Truck Trailers Prohibited
6-1-7: Administrative Variations

6-1-8: Temporary Roof Coverings

BUILDING CODE:

?\

—_—
1

N

() “The 2021 International Building Code” as published by the International Code
Council, Inc. is hereby adopted as the Building Code of the Village with the following changes,
additions or insertions:

Section 101.1, insert “Village of Bridgeview”.

Section 101.4.3, Change the words “International Plumbing Code” to “Illinois Plumbing Code™.
Change the last sentence to read “Private sewage disposal systems are prohibited”. Add the
following sentence: “Whenever the International Plumbing Code is referenced, the reference
shall be to the Illinois Plumbing Code”.

Section 102.4.1, change the last sentence to read “In the event of conflict between this code and
any referenced code or other ordinance of the Village, the most stringent provisions shall be
applied unless the building official otherwise determines™.

Section 103.1, delete in full.

Section 103.2, change first sentence to read “The building official shall be the Building
Commissioner”

Section 105.2, delete paragraph 1,2,4, and 6 under Building.

Revised , 2/06/2013, 08/15/2018, 7/6/2022
Revised 03/17/2010, 7/20/201 1
Revised 10/06/2004, 02/07/2007
6-1-1



Section 109.4, add the following to read “A penalty of not less than $100 nor more than $750 is
hereby imposed for each violation. Each day that a violation occurs shall be considered a separate
violation and subject to penalty.”

Section 113.1, delete the last two sentences and add “The board of appeals shall be the Board of
Trustees.”

Section 113.2, change the last sentence to read “The board shall have the authority to waive the
requirements of this Code for due cause in hardship situations, which decision to waive shall not
be subject to further appeal.”

Section 114.4, add the following, “A penalty of not less than $100 nor more than $750 is hereby
imposed for each violation of this Code. Each day that a violation occurs shall be considered a
separate violation and subject to penalty.”

Section 903.2, add the following: “Automatic sprinkler systems are required to be installed in
residential structures only where the residential structure contains more than 10,000 square feet of
dwelling space or where the residential structure also contains commercial space within the same
structure and the commercial space is required to be sprinklered.”

Section 1209.1, add the following, “The minimum height for a crawl space shall be 3 feet. All crawl
spaces shall have a minimum 2-inch concrete cement floor with vapor barrier.”

Section 1209.2, add the following, “Where a furnace is located in an attic, the furnace shall be
located in an enclosed insulation room of not less than 64 square feet of flat area with a walkway of
a minimum 24 inches wide to the furnace from the access opening.”

Section 1612.3, change the second sentence to read “The flood hazard map shall be the most recent
flood insurance rate map issued by the Federal Emergency Management Agency, as amended from
time to time.”

Section 1807.1, add the following, “All foundations and foundation walls shall be concrete
foundations and no other materials may be used.”

Section 1807.1.3, delete in full.

Section 1807.1.4, delete in full.

Section 1807.1.5, add the following, “Masonry foundation walls are not permitted.”
Section 1809.9 delete in full.

Section 1809.12, delete in full.
Revised 07/06/2022, 8/15/2018,

Revised 02/06/2013, 3/17/2010, 02/07/2007, 10/6/2004
6-1-2



The following Appendixes are hereby declared to be mandatory: Appendix D, Appendix F,
Appendix G, Appendix H, Appendix J, Appendix K.

Appendix D, Fire Districts, Section D101.1 change first sentence to read “The fire district shall
include all territory within the Village”.

Appendix H, Signs, is hereby adopted, but nothing therein shall permit the erection or
maintenance of any sign unless permitted by the zoning ordinance.

Appendix K, Administrative Provisions, Section K111.1, is changed by adding a sentence to read
“The Chicago Electrical Code shall apply within the Village and shall be the electrical code and
govern all electrical installation and maintenance”.

6-1-2: INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE.

(a) The “2021 International Residential Code”, as published by the International Code
Council, Inc. is hereby adopted as the International Residential Code (for One- and Two-Family
Dwellings) of the Village with the following changes, additions or insertions:

Section R101.1, insert "Village of Bridgeview.”

Section R102.4.1, change the last sentence to read “In the event of conflict between this code and
any referenced code or other ordinance of the Village, the most stringent provisions shall be
applied unless the building official otherwise determines.”

Section R103.1, delete in full.

Section R103.2, change first sentence to read “The building official shall be the Building
Commissioner”.

Section R105.2, delete paragraph 1, 2, 3, 5, 9, and 10 under Building.

Section R108.6, add the following to read “The additional fee for commencing work without
obtaining the necessary permits shall be $50 per day measured from the time that work began
until the required permits are obtained. This fee shall be paid at the time that the permits are

issued.”
Section R112.1, change to read “All appeals shall be taken as provided in the Building Code.”
Section R112.3, delete in full.

Section R112.4, delete in full.

Revised 07/06/2022, 08/15/2018. 02/06/2013, 08/15/2018
6-1-3



Section R113.4, add the following, “A penalty of not less than $100 nor more than $750 is
hereby imposed for each violation of this Code. Each day that a violation occurs shall be
considered a separate violation and subject to penalty.”

Table R301.2 (1), Insert, “The building official shall determine the applicable criteria from the
referenced tables and figures.”

Section R401.2, insert “All foundations and foundation walls shall be poured concrete and no
other materials may be used.”

Section R402.1, delete, in full, including Section R402.1.1 and Section R402.1.2.
Section R402.3, delete in full, including Section R402.3.1.
Section R402.4, delete in full.

Section R403.1, change the first sentence to read, “All footings shall be poured concrete footings
and no other materials may be used.”

Section R404.1, change the last sentence to read, “All foundation walls and retaining walls shall
be concrete and no other materials may be used.”

Section R404.1.1, delete the last sentence as masonry foundation walls are prohibited.
Section R404.1.2, delete in full, including Section R404.1.2.1.

Section R404.1.4.1, delete in full.

Section R404.1.5.1, delete in full.

Section R404.1.5.3, delete in full.

Section R404.1.8, delete in full.

Section R404.2 delete in full.

Section R404.5, delete in full.

Section R408.1, add the following, “The minimum height for a crawl space shall be 3 feet. All
crawl spaces shall have a minimum 2-inch concrete cement floor with vapor barrier.”

Revised 02/06/2013. 08/15/2018. 07/06/2022
6-1-4



Section R807.1, add the following, “Where a furnace is located in an attic, the furnace shall be
located in an enclosed insulation room of not less than 64 square feet of flat area with a walkway
of a minimum 24 inches wide to the furnace from the access opening.”

Section P2601.1, change paragraph to read “Only methods, materials, construction and systems
allowed by the Illinois Plumbing Code are permitted.”

Section P2603.5.1, delete in full as private sewage disposal systems are not permitted.

Section P2904.1, add the following: “Automatic sprinkler systems are required to be installed in
residential structures only where the residential structure contains more than 10,000 square feet
of dwelling space or where the residential structure also contains commercial space within the
same structure and commercial space is required to be sprinklered.”

Section E3401.1, Change paragraph to read “Only wiring methods, materials, construction and
systems allowed under the Chicago Electrical Code are permitted.”

The following Appendixes are hereby declared to be mandatory: Appendix AA, Appendix AB,
Appendix AC, Appendix AD, Appendix AF, Appendix AG, Appendix AH, Appendix AJ,
Appendix AK, Appendix AM,. Appendix AN, Appendix AP, and Appendix AT.

6-1-3: ADOPTION OF AMENDMENTS:  The following exceptions, deletions,
additions and modifications to the Building Code of the Village of Bridgeview are
hereby adopted:

Section 709.2.1 of Article 7 is amended to read as follow: In buildings and
structures constructed without basements, a space shall be provided under the first
floor no less than 18 inches in depth as measured from the bottom of the floor
joists; and such space shall be vented with screened openings having a clear area
of not less than 1/3 of one percent of the enclosed building area, or shall be
provided with other means of ventilation approved by the Building
Commissioner, and such space shall be provided with a vapor barrier of a type and
material as approved by the Building Commissioner.

Sections 1207.0, 1207.10, 1207.2, and 1207.3 of Article 12 are deleted.
Section 1209.7 of Article 12 shall be added as follows:

No trenching or bell footings shall be allowed.

Section 1210.0, 1210.1, and 1210.2 of Article 12 are deleted.

Section 1211.0 of Article 12 is deleted.

Revised 07/06/2022, 08/15/2018, 02/06/2013
6-1-3



Section 1602.0 of Article 16 is deleted and, in lieu of the language in that section,
shall read as follows and shall be applicable:

No exterior wall shall be of stucco construction.

Sections 1704, 1704.1, 1704.1.1, 1704.1.2, 1704.1.3, 1704.2, 1704.2.1, 1704.2.2,
1704.3.2 of Article 17 shall be deleted and in lieu of the language in those
sections, shall read as follows and shall be applicable: Glued and laminated
beams shall be of framing material.

6-1-4 Blank

6-1-5: SIDEWALKS: The construction of public sidewalks is required on all

public right-of-ways adjoining property on which a new residential structure
is being constructed. No occupancy permit shall be granted until the public sidewalks have
been constructed. The provisions of this section may only be waived by the Mayor and
Board of Trustees.

6-1-6: STORAGE CONTAINERS AND TRUCK TRAILERS PROHIBITED: It shall

be unlawful for any person to use, or to allow to be maintained on any property,
any storage container, ocean cargo container, shipping container, truck container, truck trailer, or
similar type container which is used to store materials. All indoor storage of materials must be in a
permanent structure which is constructed on a foundation. The use of a storage container, ocean
cargo container, shipping container, truck container, truck trailer, or similar type container is not
permitted when located outside of a permitted permanent building on the property.

6-1-7 ADMINISTRATIVE VARIATIONS: The Director of Buildings and

Inspectional Services shall, with the consent of the Mayor, have the authority and
power to waive or modify any provisions of the Building Code, Electrical Code, Plumbing Code,
Mechanical Code and Property Maintenance Code when such waiver or modification would not
endanger the public health, safety or welfare; or where there are practical difficulties, economic
hardship, or other circumstances in carrying out the strict provisions thereof. The Director of
Buildings and Inspectional Services shall, with the consent of the Mayor, have this discretionary
authority and shall not be subject to any liability for such waiver or modification. The terms and
provisions of any waiver of modification shall be placed in writing and shall be accepted by the
property owner or property occupant.

Revised 7/20/2011
Revised 7/14/99, Revised 7/17/02

6-1-6



6-1-8 TEMPORARY ROOF COVERINGS: No person shall place a tarp on a roof or
any temporary roof covering on any structure, including main structures and accessory structures,
without first obtaining a permit therefor. All tarps and temporary roof coverings shall be fire
resistant effective against light fire exposure. All permits issued shall expire 30 days after the
date of issuance, unless extended by the Building Commissioner. The fee for a temporary roof
covering permit shall be $25.00 for each 30 days or part thereof. Applicants are required to post a
$100.00 cash bond as a prerequisite to obtaining such permit, which bond shall be returned to the
applicant upon removal of the temporary roof covering within the timeframe allowed by the
permit. If a temporary roof covering is not removed by the expiration date of the permit for such
temporary roof covering, the Village may cause the removal of such temporary roof covering and
use the cash bond to pay for said removal.

Revised 8/7/19
6-1-7



CHAPTER 6.

BUILDING CONSTRUCTION AND MAINTENANCE CODES

ARTICLE 2. CLASSIFICATION OF BUILDINGS
SECTION

6-2-1: Establishment of Classification.
6-2-2: Other Classification.

6-2-3: Change of Classification.

6-2-4: Rules and Regulations.

6-2-5: Minimum Area/Class A.

6-2-5.1: Class B, Multifamily Buildings/Fireproof Construction.
6-2-6: Construction/Class C.

6-2-7: Special Provisions.

6-2-8: Construction/Classes D and E.
6-2-9: Fireproof Construction.

6-2-10: Live Loads in Construction of Floors.
6-2-11: Entrance Halls.

6-2-12: Means of Egress.

6-2-13: Stairways.

6-2-14: Stair Halls.

6-2-15: Windows in Halls.

6-2-16: Habitable Rooms; Requirements.
6-2-17: Rooms; Sizes and Height.

6-2-18: Air Quantity for each Person.
6-2-19: Sanitary Requirements.

6-2-20: Access to Rooms.

6-2-21: Fire Walls.

6-2-22: Walls in Courts and Shafts.

6-2-23: Walls Below Ground.

6-2-24. Bulkhead in Roof.

6-2-25: Drainage of Enclosed Areas.
6-2-26: Basements.

6-2-27: Openings Around Pipes.

6-2-28: Lights in Public Halls.

6-2-29: Repair and Sanitation.

6-2-30: Construction/Class F.

6-2-31: Live Loads for Floors.

6-2-32: Fire Walls.

6-2-33: Stairways.

6-2-34: Heating, Boiler Room Construction.
6-2-35: Fire; Prohibited.

6-2-36: Housing of Vehicles.

6-2-37: Electric Lights and Equipment.
6-2-38: 01l and Grease Traps.

6-2-1: ESTABLISHMENT OF CLASSIFICATION: For the purpose of this Article, buildings shall

be classified as follows:

6-2-1



Class A Buildings; Used as single family dwellings.
Class B Buildings: Used as apartment houses.
Class C Buildings: Used as private garages.

Class D Buildings: Used for commercial purposes

Class E Buildings: Used for the purpose of Class D Buildings and in
which is located one apartment.

Class F Buildings: Used as public garages and as automobile filling stations.

6-2-2: OTHER CLASSIFICATIONS: Buildings not included within any of the
above classes, shall be fireproof unless such requirement is modified by resolution of the Board
of Trustees on recommendation of the Building Commissioner.

6-2-3: CHANGE OF CLASSIFICATION: If buildings, erected for, or converted

to, the uses of any classification mentioned in this Article, are to be applied to the uses of any
other class for which a better system of construction is required by this Article, the construction
and equipment of such buildings shall be made to conform to the requirements of this Article as
specified for their intended use. It shall be unlawful to use any such building for a new or
different purpose from that to which its structure and equipment adopt it under this Article,
unless the provisions of this Article and the provisions of the Zoning Ordinance for such new or

different use shall first have been complied with.

6-2-4: RULES AND REGULATIONS: Those certain rules and regulations entitled
‘Rules and Regulations for the Construction, Alteration, Repair and Conversion of Buildings for
Residential Purposes’, August 1947 Edition as heretofore printed in book form by the Suburban
Building Officials Conference, with the exception hereinafter noted, are hereby adopted by reference
and the same shall be and are hereby made a part of this Code with the same force and effect as
though specifically and particularly set forth herein, and all of such rules and regulations except
Sections 209, 210 and 313D which are hereby expressly excluded shall apply to all buildings for
residential purposes. Dry wall finish for interior walls and ceilings shall be permitted.

6-2-5: CONSTRUCTION/CLASS A & B RESIDENTIAL:

a. Class A & B residential exterior veneers shall contain face brick or stone
on not less than 75 percent of the exterior walls on all sides and shall contain face brick or stone
on 100 percent on all first floor and ground levels above foundation. Hereafter, all additions to

existing structures shall match the existing structure.

6-2-2



b. Minimum Area/Class A: Buildings of Class ‘A’ shall have the following
minimum area:

One story residences shall have at least 700 square feet in total living area and two story
residences shall have at least 500 square feet on the first floor, provided that there are at least two
complete rooms on the second floor comprising of not less than 200 square feet. These areas are
exclusive of all porches, bays, furnace rooms, laundry rooms and attached garages.

6-2-5.1: CLASS B, MULTIFAMILY BUILDINGS/FIREPROOF CONSTRUCTION:

Buildings constructed in the R-3 and R-4 Multifamily Residence Districts, that are
allowed in the permitted Uses and the permitted Special Uses, shall have flexicore construction
for floors; corridor walls shall be of masonry construction with a minimum fire rating of 2 hours.
Fire walls of upper floors of the building shall extend tot he underside of the roof line. Electric
closets shall be enclosed with masonry walls of 2 hour fire ratings.

6-2-6: Construction/Class C:  No structure erected for or converted to the

purpose of Class ‘C’ shall exceed eight feet in wall height, 30 feet in length, 24 feet
in width, or 720 square feet in floor area. No Gambrel or Mansard roofs shall be allowed. All
overhead doors shall be on the street side (front side) of the garage. In the case of a unique
design or layout, the Building Commissioner shall determine the location, numbers, and size (s) of
the door (s), but under no circumstances shall overhead door (s) be allowed on more than one

wall of any garage.

All Class C structures shall be located (1) at least ten feet from the primary structure on the
property or (2) shall be at least five feet from the primary structure and maintain a one-hour fire
code rating by installing 5/8” fire coded drywall on garage walls and ceiling. A Class C structure
is allowed one 15 amp electrical circuit for lighting and one 20 amp electrical circuit for outlets.
in garages that exceed 24 feet in length, the footings shall be a bond beam on all four sides and a
bond beam shall be installed along the centers with regard to both length and width. Footing
depth shall be 12 inches below grade and footing width shall be 16 inches at grade and 10 inches
at the bottom. Floor slabs shall be made of concrete with 6”x6” wire mesh of No. 11 gauge and
shall be at least 5” thick. Each header shall be constructed of at least three boards with
dimensions of at least 2”x12” with bolts of at least 3/8” diameter. (Laminated beams measuring
2”x4”x12” may be used in place of the previous requirement for headers.) Wall corners shall be
constructed of 4°x8°x1/2” CDX plywood. Cross ties and hangers shall be located at every other

rafter.

6-2-7: SPECIAL PROVISIONS: Buildings used for the purpose of a private garage

shall not contain living quarters. Private garages attached to residences, or located
in the basements of residences, shall have walls and ceilings plastered on metal lath, and the floors
thereof shall be of fireproof construction. All openings between the vehicle room and other parts
of the building shall be provided with metal covered doors and frames.

6-2-3



6-2-8: CONSTRUCTION/CLASS D AND E: All Commercial and Tndustrial Buildings
in the C-1, C-2, C-3, C-4 and I-1 zoning shall be constructed of brick or stone.

All buildings in the I-2 zone shall be constructed of brick, stone or other non-combustible
materials.

6-2-9: FIREPROOF CONSTRUCTION:

a. Class ‘D’ and ‘E’ buildings, including but not limited to Hotels and Motels,
Convalescent, Nursing Homes, Sanitariums, Hospitals and Residences above a business,
constructed in the Commercial and Industrial Zoning Districts, that are allowed in the permitted
Uses and permitted Special Uses, shall have flexicore construction for floors; corridor walls shall
be of masonry construction with a minimum fire rating of 2 hours. Fire walls of upper floors of
the building shall extend to the underside of the roof line. Electric closets shall be enclosed with

masonry walls of 2 hour ratings.

b. Every building erected for or converted to the purposes of Class E shall
have the basement and first floor portions, including the floor construction which forms the ceiling
of the first floor, entirely of fireproof construction. All stairways shall be constructed of fireproof
material, and the stair halls shall be as required in Section 6-2-14.

6-2-10: LIVE LOADS IN CONSTRUCTION OF FLOORS: In every building of classes
D and E, the floor shall be designed and constructed in such manner as to be
capable of bearing in all their parts, in addition to the weight of the floor construction, partitions,
permanent fixtures and mechanism that may be set upon same, a live load of 100 pounds for every
square foot of surface on the first floor and of 50 pounds for every square foot of surface on the

second floor.

6-2-11: ENTRANCE HALLS: Every main entrance hall in buildings of Classes D and E
shall be at least 3 feet 6 inches wide, in the clear, from the entrance up to and

including the stair enclosures, and beyond this point such halls shall be at least 3 feet wide in the

clear. Every apartment or office shall be directly accessible from an entrance hall by means of at

least one flight of stairs.

6-2-12: MEANS OF EGRESS: In every building of Classes D and E, every apartment
or office, above the first floor, shall have at least two independent means of egress
located remote from each other and extending continuously to a street, or to a court or yard
connecting with the street, and so arranged that each may be reached from any office or
apartment without having to pass through another. One of such means of egress shall be an
interior stairway and the other may be an additional interior stairway or outside exit stairway. In
every building of Class E, the second means of exit, in case it is not a regular stairway, shall be so
located and arranged as to connect directly to at least one room or private hallway in each
apartment and such room or private hallway shall be accessible to every room of the
apartment. The connection shall not be made through a bathroom or water closet compartment,

and shall not be obstructed in any manner.
6-2-4








































































